
John #38 – The Last Supper – 2-02-23 
 
John 13:1–17 
It was just before the Passover Festival. Jesus knew that the hour had come for him to leave this world 
and go to the Father. Having loved his own who were in the world, he loved them to the end.  
 
2 The evening meal was in progress, and the devil had already prompted Judas, the son of Simon Iscariot, 
to betray Jesus. 3 Jesus knew that the Father had put all things under his power, and that he had come 
from God and was returning to God; 4 so he got up from the meal, took off his outer clothing, and 
wrapped a towel around his waist. 5 After that, he poured water into a basin and began to wash his 
disciples’ feet, drying them with the towel that was wrapped around him.  
 
6 He came to Simon Peter, who said to him, “Lord, are you going to wash my feet?” 
  
7 Jesus replied, “You do not realize now what I am doing, but later you will understand.” 
  
8 “No,” said Peter, “you shall never wash my feet.” 
  
Jesus answered, “Unless I wash you, you have no part with me.”  
 
9 “Then, Lord,” Simon Peter replied, “not just my feet but my hands and my head as well!”  
10 Jesus answered, “Those who have had a bath need only to wash their feet; their whole body is clean. 
And you are clean, though not every one of you.” 11 For he knew who was going to betray him, and that 
was why he said not every one was clean.  
 
12 When he had finished washing their feet, he put on his clothes and returned to his place. “Do you 
understand what I have done for you?” he asked them. 13 “You call me ‘Teacher’ and ‘Lord,’ and rightly 
so, for that is what I am. 14 Now that I, your Lord and Teacher, have washed your feet, you also should 
wash one another’s feet. 15 I have set you an example that you should do as I have done for you. 16 Very 
truly I tell you, no servant is greater than his master, nor is a messenger greater than the one who sent 
him. 17 Now that you know these things, you will be blessed if you do them. 
 
Luke 22:7–16 
7 Then came the day of Unleavened Bread on which the Passover lamb had to be sacrificed. 8 Jesus sent 
Peter and John, saying, “Go and make preparations for us to eat the Passover.”  
 
9 “Where do you want us to prepare for it?” they asked. 
  
10 He replied, “As you enter the city, a man carrying a jar of water will meet you. Follow him to the house 
that he enters, 11 and say to the owner of the house, ‘The Teacher asks: Where is the guest room, where 
I may eat the Passover with my disciples?’ 12 He will show you a large room upstairs, all furnished. Make 
preparations there.” 
  
13 They left and found things just as Jesus had told them. So they prepared the Passover. 
  
14 When the hour came, Jesus and his apostles reclined at the table. 15 And he said to them, “I have 
eagerly desired to eat this Passover with you before I suffer. 16 For I tell you, I will not eat it again until it 
finds fulfillment in the kingdom of God.” 



 
John 18:28 
28 Then the Jewish leaders took Jesus from Caiaphas to the palace of the Roman governor. By now it was 
early morning, and to avoid ceremonial uncleanness they did not enter the palace, because they wanted 
to be able to eat the Passover. 
 
 
John 19:13–14 
13 When Pilate heard this, he brought Jesus out and sat down on the judge’s seat at a place known as the 
Stone Pavement (which in Aramaic is Gabbatha). 14 It was the day of Preparation of the Passover; it was 
about noon. 
 
 
Luke 22:24–27 
24 A dispute also arose among them as to which of them was considered to be greatest. 25 Jesus said to 
them, “The kings of the Gentiles lord it over them; and those who exercise authority over them call 
themselves Benefactors. 26 But you are not to be like that. Instead, the greatest among you should be 
like the youngest, and the one who rules like the one who serves. 27 For who is greater, the one who is at 
the table or the one who serves? Is it not the one who is at the table? But I am among you as one who 
serves. 
 
 
Philippians 2:5–11 
5 In your relationships with one another, have the same mindset as Christ Jesus:  
 
6 Who, being in very nature God, did not consider equality with God something to be used to his own 
advantage;  
 
7 rather, he made himself nothing by taking the very nature of a servant, being made in human likeness.  
 

8 And being found in appearance as a man, he humbled himself by becoming obedient to death— even 
death on a cross!  
 
9 Therefore God exalted him to the highest place and gave him the name that is above every name, 
  
10 that at the name of Jesus every knee should bow, in heaven and on earth and under the earth, 
  
11 and every tongue acknowledge that Jesus Christ is Lord, to the glory of God the Father.  
 
 
 
 


